
GOLIAD COUNTY COURTHOUSE
127 N. COURTHOUSE SQUARE, GOLIAD, TX

5:00 Call to Order
5:05 Invocation
5:10 Pledge of Allegiance to U.S. Flag and to Texas Flag

Deliberation and action on the following items:

1. Public Communication
Members of the public may give comment before the Commissioners Court on any item listed on this
agenda during the time allocated for public comment on the Agenda. During Public Communication,
members of the public may communicate to the Court about County issues not on the agenda.
However, any matter raised during Public Communication, County Announcements, or any other
subject not specifically noticed on this agenda, the Court cannot deliberate or take action on any item
not included in the Agenda for that session of the Court; Court members may interact with the Public
during public communications only by providing factual information or existing policy, if such facts
and/or policy are known. 
Pursuant to Rules of Decorum adopted by the Commissioners Court, the presiding officer may limit
the time allotted to public comment/communication to allow adequate deliberation of posted items by
the Commissioners Court.

2. Consent Agenda
a. Approval of accounts payable for Goliad County
b. Approval of payroll for Goliad County
c. Approval of budget transfers
d. Approval of May 28th, 2024 minutes
e. Receive reports from the following county officials and departments; take appropriate

action:
Deposit Distribution Report
Ag Report
Payroll Summary Report
Library Report
Indigent Report
Budget Report

MEETING OF THE COMMISSIONERS COURT
Monday, July 22, 2024 at 5:00 pm



Check Report
JP 1
Payroll Summary Report
Auditor
JP 2
Clerk
Treasurer
Account Summary Report
Museum Report

3. Discuss and take action with approval for Pipeline Bangl/Pumpco Road Use Agreements
M. Bennett

4. Discuss and take action on approval to add Auditorium and Fairgrounds buildings to County
Property Insurance.
M. Bennett / D. Young

5. Discuss and take action on request from Goliad County Sheriff's Office for approval to
submit SCAAP grant application
M. Bennett / R. Boyd

6. Discuss and take action on the purchase of approximately $67,000 of investigative
equipment for the sheriff's office from Narcotics Fund
M.Bennett / T.Poynter

7. Discuss and take action on changing contracts from Code Red to ReGroup for mass
notifications for Goliad County
M.Bennett / S.Ontiveros

8. Discuss and take action on approval for Ed Rachal Foundation Grant, Lillie A Johnson, Gary
Sinise Foundation, Leary Firefighters Foundation for Fire Marshal K. Story for SCBA units for
County VFDs
M.Bennett / K.Garcia

9. Discuss and take action on approval for applying to the LCRA Grant for Generator EMS
Building
M.Bennett / K.Garcia

10. Discuss and take action on approval of contract for Langford Berclair Standpipe Grant
#CFC23-0253
M.Bennett / K.Garcia

11. Discuss and take action on approval on STRAC & EMS
M. Bennett / H.Gregory

12. Discuss and take action on adopting 2024 Resolution for Investment Policy
M.Bennett / C.Hernandez & M.Duval

13. Award of Road & Bridges Material Bids
M. Benentt / L. Lockwood

Material List
Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions
McMahan Services
ABN Construction
Atascosa Materials
Cat Skinner
Vulcan Construction

14. Public Announcements



15. Adjourn
The Commissioners Court may go into a closed session as permitted by the Texas Open Meetings
Act (Chapter 551 of the Texas Government Code) regarding any item on this agenda. Immediately
before any closed session, the specific section or sections of the Open Meetings Act that provide
statutory authority will be announced.

Signed and dated on the __ day of ____, 2024

Mike Bennett, County Judge

Posted at ____ A.M./P.M. on the _____ day of _________________, 2024 on the bulletin board at
the door of the County Courthouse

Vickie Quinn, County Clerk

by: ________________________________

Contact: Sarah Ontiveros (sontiveros@goliadcountytx.gov 3616453337) | Agenda published on 07/19/2024 at 7:18
AM
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County of Goliad, TX

Summary By Department
Payroll Report for Comm Court

6/21/2024 - 6/21/2024

Payroll Set:  1-1

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  Commissioner Pct 1 - Commissioner Pct 1

Pay Code
1 25.000.00Cell Phone - Cell Phone
1 1,892.590.00Salary - Salary
1 384.620.00Vehicle Allowance - Vehicle Allow

2,302.210.00304 - Edwards Total:

304 Edwards, Kenneth

1 0.003.39Comp Time Earned - Comp Time 
1 106.488.00Holiday - Holiday
1 884.0566.42Hourly - Hourly
1 46.593.50Sick - Sick

1,037.1281.31391 - Osterson Total:

391 Osterson, Michael

1 0.004.53Comp Time Earned - Comp Time 
1 123.768.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,088.6270.37Hourly - Hourly

1,212.3882.901583 - Reyes Total:

1583 Reyes, David

1 149.987.19Comp Time Used - Comp Time U
1 166.888.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,351.9464.81Hourly - Hourly

1,668.8080.0051 - Sanchez Total:

51 Sanchez, Vincente

1 0.000.44Comp Time Earned - Comp Time 
1 151.128.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,027.8054.41Hourly - Hourly
1 94.455.00Sick - Sick
1 232.3512.30Vacation - Vacation

1,505.7280.15258 - Wells Total:

258 Wells, Lawrence

Commissioner Pct 1 - Commissioner Pct 1 Total: 324.36 7,726.23

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  Commissioner Pct 2 - Commissioner Pct 2

Pay Code
1 618.8040.00Hourly - Hourly

618.8040.001641 - Bennett Total:
1641 Bennett, Timothy
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Payroll Set:  1-1

1 0.005.54Comp Time Earned - Comp Time 
1 42.702.00Comp Time Used - Comp Time U
1 170.808.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,609.1575.37Hourly - Hourly

1,822.6590.9152 - Flores Total:

52 Flores, Reynaldo

1 36.622.00Comp Time Used - Comp Time U
1 146.488.00Holiday - Holiday
1 633.7034.61Hourly - Hourly
1 647.9935.39Vacation - Vacation

1,464.7980.0067 - Krause Total:

67 Krause, Russell

1 73.564.00Hourly - Hourly
73.564.0054 - Martinez Total:

54 Martinez, Rufino

1 25.000.00Cell Phone - Cell Phone
1 1,892.590.00Salary - Salary
1 384.620.00Vehicle Allowance - Vehicle Allow

2,302.210.001575 - Young Total:

1575 Young, David

Commissioner Pct 2 - Commissioner Pct 2  Total: 214.91 6,282.01

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  Commissioner Pct 3 - Commissioner Pct 3

Pay Code
1 25.000.00Cell Phone - Cell Phone
1 1,892.590.00Salary - Salary
1 384.620.00Vehicle Allowance - Vehicle Allow

2,302.210.0058 - Brumby Total:

58 Brumby, Kirby

1 222.1416.69Hourly - Hourly
222.1416.691544 - Casten Total:

1544 Casten, Philip

1 225.4716.94Hourly - Hourly
225.4716.941445 - Innocenti Total:

1445 Innocenti, Deborah

1 0.000.53Comp Time Earned - Comp Time 
1 32.182.08Comp Time Used - Comp Time U
1 123.768.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,081.6669.92Hourly - Hourly

1,237.6080.53144 - Karnei Total:

144 Karnei, Dustin

1 103.448.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,021.4779.00Hourly - Hourly
1 38.793.00Vacation - Vacation

1,163.7090.001622 - Moncivaiz Total:

1622 Moncivaiz, Efrain
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Payroll Set:  1-1

1 38.312.03Comp Time Used - Comp Time U
1 150.968.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,319.9669.95Hourly - Hourly

1,509.2379.981491 - Rojas Total:

1491 Rojas, Arthur

1 775.0259.94Hourly - Hourly
775.0259.941897 - Stephens Total:

1897 Stephens, Trey

Commissioner Pct 3 - Commissioner Pct 3  Total: 344.08 7,435.37

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  Commissioner Pct 4 - Commissioner Pct 4

Pay Code
1 127.448.00Holiday - Holiday
1 988.9362.08Hourly - Hourly
1 158.039.92Sick - Sick

1,274.4080.001527 - Cornish Total:

1527 Cornish, Keith

1 25.000.00Cell Phone - Cell Phone
1 1,892.590.00Salary - Salary
1 384.620.00Vehicle Allowance - Vehicle Allow

2,302.210.001487 - Fagg Total:

1487 Fagg, Kevin

1 161.848.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,276.7263.11Hourly - Hourly
1 179.848.89Sick - Sick

1,618.4080.0066 - Fromme Total:

66 Fromme, Cliff

1 598.8837.50Hourly - Hourly
598.8837.5068 - Pantel Total:

68 Pantel, Devin

1 977.4063.18Hourly - Hourly
977.4063.18376 - Pantel Total:

376 Pantel, Jade

Commissioner Pct 4 - Commissioner Pct 4  Total: 260.68 6,771.29

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  Constable Pct 1 - Constable Pct 1

Pay Code
1 1,885.502.00Salary - Salary

1,885.502.001492 - Story Total:
1492 Story, Kevin

Constable Pct 1 - Constable Pct 1 Total: 2.00 1,885.50
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Payroll Set:  1-1

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  Constable Pct 2 - Constable Pct 2

Pay Code
1 1,039.3540.00Salary - Salary

1,039.3540.001595 - Zappe Total:
1595 Zappe, William

Constable Pct 2 - Constable Pct 2 Total: 40.00 1,039.35

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  County Attorney - County Attorney

Pay Code
1 178.088.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,370.3361.56Hourly - Hourly
1 52.532.36Sick - Sick
1 179.868.08Vacation - Vacation

1,780.8080.0017 - Torres Total:

17 Torres, Shirley

County Attorney - County Attorney Total: 80.00 1,780.80

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  County Auditor - County Auditor

Pay Code
1 2,448.220.00Salary - Salary

2,448.220.00378 - Lockwood Total:
378 Lockwood, Leigh

County Auditor - County Auditor Total: 0.00 2,448.22

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  County District Clk - County District Clerk

Pay Code
1 0.000.51Comp Time Earned - Comp Time 
1 131.208.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,189.3372.52Hourly - Hourly

1,320.5381.0324 - Bland Total:

24 Bland, Annie

1 0.002.27Comp Time Earned - Comp Time 
1 112.168.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,017.7172.59Hourly - Hourly

1,129.8782.861606 - Burns Total:

1606 Burns, Andrea

1 1,978.350.00Salary - Salary
1,978.350.0029 - Quinn Total:

29 Quinn, Victoria

1 108.568.00Holiday - Holiday
1 958.5870.64Hourly - Hourly
1 18.461.36Sick - Sick

1,085.6080.0036 - Rangel Total:

36 Rangel, Lorinda
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Payroll Set:  1-1

1 109.448.00Holiday - Holiday
1 929.4267.94Hourly - Hourly

1,038.8675.941518 - Story Total:

1518 Story, Lori

County District Clk - County District Clerk Total: 319.83 6,553.21

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  County Judge - County Judge

Pay Code
1 25.000.00Cell Phone - Cell Phone
1 2,097.430.00Salary - Salary
1 969.230.00State Suppliment - State Supplim

3,091.660.00374 - Bennett Total:

374 Bennett, Roger

1 69.193.92Hourly - Hourly
1 842.9647.76Vaction- Payout  - Vaction- Payou

912.1551.681588 - Dobbs Total:

1588 Dobbs, Dana

1 1,011.2157.39Hourly - Hourly
1,011.2157.391640 - Garcia Total:

1640 Garcia, Katy

1 25.000.00Cell Phone - Cell Phone
1 0.005.72Comp Time Earned - Comp Time 
1 140.968.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,268.6472.00Hourly - Hourly

1,434.6085.721578 - Ontiveros Total:

1578 Ontiveros, Sarah

County Judge - County Judge Total: 194.79 6,449.62

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  County Treasurer - County Treasurer

Pay Code
1 0.000.62Comp Time Earned - Comp Time 
1 140.968.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,229.7069.79Hourly - Hourly
1 38.942.21Sick - Sick

1,409.6080.621536 - Duval Total:

1536 Duval, Michelle

1 1,880.570.00Salary - Salary
1,880.570.004 - Hernandez Total:

4 Hernandez, Christina

County Treasurer - County Treasurer Total: 80.62 3,290.17
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Payroll Set:  1-1

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  Dispatch - Dispatch

Pay Code
1 147.048.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,470.4080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 337.1812.23Overtime - Overtime

1,954.62100.2388 - Carbajal Total:

88 Carbajal, Ricardo

1 147.048.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,470.4080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 125.724.56Overtime - Overtime

1,743.1692.561545 - Castro Total:

1545 Castro, Brittany

1 147.048.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,470.4080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 174.526.33Overtime - Overtime

1,791.9694.331558 - Kramer Total:

1558 Kramer, Isaac

1 147.048.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,470.4080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 1.100.04Overtime - Overtime

1,618.5488.041531 - Maldonado Total:

1531 Maldonado, Tina

1 151.848.00Holiday - Holiday
1 688.7836.29Hourly - Hourly
1 683.2836.00Sick - Sick
1 227.7612.00Vacation - Vacation

1,751.6692.29313 - Revilla Total:

313 Revilla, Cassie

1 147.048.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,470.4080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 137.304.98Overtime - Overtime

1,754.7492.981577 - Sprague Total:

1577 Sprague, Shayleigh

1 200.728.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,957.2778.01Hourly - Hourly

2,157.9986.01125 - Weise Total:

125 Weise, Rebecca

Dispatch - Dispatch Total: 646.44 12,772.67

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  District Attorney - District Attorney

Pay Code
1 4,000.0080.00Salary - Salary

4,000.0080.001620 - Gray Total:
1620 Gray, Benjamin

1 4,269.2380.00Salary - Salary
4,269.2380.001601 - Poynter Total:

1601 Poynter, Timothy
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Payroll Set:  1-1

1 241.208.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,602.4853.15Hourly - Hourly
1 565.3118.75Vacation - Vacation

2,408.9979.901598 - Sammons Total:

1598 Sammons, Chyann

1 189.688.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,398.8959.00Hourly - Hourly
1 308.2313.00Vacation - Vacation

1,896.8080.001600 - Sanchez Total:

1600 Sanchez, Evangelina

1 1,978.8580.00Salary - Salary
1,978.8580.001599 - Schlinger Total:

1599 Schlinger, John

District Attorney - District Attorney Total: 399.90 14,553.87

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  Elections Admin - Elections Administrator

Pay Code
1 136.888.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,020.7859.66Hourly - Hourly
1 211.1412.34Sick - Sick

1,368.8080.0032 - Edison Total:

32 Edison, Norma

Elections Admin - Elections Administrator Total: 80.00 1,368.80

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  EMS - EMS

Pay Code
1 103.848.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,038.4080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 316.0016.23Overtime - Overtime

1,458.24104.231961 - Barnett Total:

1961 Barnett, Destini

1 151.128.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,511.2080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 1,997.3370.49Overtime - Overtime

3,659.65158.491541 - Clair Total:

1541 Clair, James

1 103.848.00Holiday - Holiday
1 829.9463.94Hourly - Hourly
1 155.377.98Overtime - Overtime
1 311.5224.00Vacation - Vacation

1,400.67103.92383 - Garcia Total:

383 Garcia, Jami

1 103.848.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,038.4080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 324.1816.65Overtime - Overtime

1,466.42104.651591 - Glocar Total:

1591 Glocar, Ember
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Payroll Set:  1-1

1 2,263.8880.00Salary - Salary
2,263.8880.001604 - Gregory Total:

1604 Gregory, Holli

1 151.128.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,511.2080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 2,106.7174.35Overtime - Overtime
1 1,992.52105.48Vaction- Payout  - Vaction- Payou

5,761.55267.831496 - Gullette Total:

1496 Gullette, Arik

1 1,662.3288.00Hourly - Hourly
1 454.7816.05Overtime - Overtime

2,117.10104.051636 - Gutierrez Total:

1636 Gutierrez, Vanessa

1 158.008.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,580.0080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 1,890.0863.80Overtime - Overtime

3,628.08151.8074 - Hajek Total:

74 Hajek, Shawn

1 143.288.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,432.8080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 431.7216.07Overtime - Overtime

2,007.80104.0775 - Johnson Total:

75 Johnson, Dawn

1 1,511.2080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 1,821.6664.29Overtime - Overtime

3,332.86144.29390 - McKenzie Total:

390 McKenzie, Alfred

1 564.0040.00Hourly - Hourly
1 170.268.05Overtime - Overtime

734.2648.051621 - Meyer Total:

1621 Meyer, Joshua

1 353.5424.05Hourly - Hourly
353.5424.051638 - Montes Total:

1638 Montes, Derrick

1 151.128.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,511.2080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 451.6615.94Overtime - Overtime

2,113.98103.941603 - Munselle Total:

1603 Munselle, Adaniel

1 155.928.00Holiday - Holiday
1 779.6040.00Hourly - Hourly
1 950.4332.51Overtime - Overtime
1 935.5248.00Vacation - Vacation

2,821.47128.51246 - Schaefer Total:

246 Schaefer, Pamela

1 103.848.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,038.4080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 787.9540.47Overtime - Overtime

1,930.19128.471962 - Ulloa Total:

1962 Ulloa, Tayra
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Payroll Set:  1-1

1 601.6531.85Hourly - Hourly
601.6531.851615 - Villegas Total:

1615 Villegas, Jose

EMS - EMS Total: 1,788.20 35,651.34

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  Extension Office - Extension Office

Pay Code
1 508.9343.35Hourly - Hourly
1 93.928.00Sick - Sick

602.8551.35384 - Albrecht Total:

384 Albrecht, Alethea

1 25.000.00Cell Phone - Cell Phone
1 165.848.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,126.4754.34Hourly - Hourly
1 375.0118.09Sick - Sick

1,692.3280.4322 - Berger Total:

22 Berger, Tracy

1 25.000.00Cell Phone - Cell Phone
1 650.020.00Salary - Salary
1 259.610.00Vehicle Allowance - Vehicle Allow

934.630.0023 - Yanta Total:

23 Yanta, Brian

Extension Office - Extension Office Total: 131.78 3,229.80

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  GCRP Transit - GCRP Transit

Pay Code
1 620.9846.62Hourly - Hourly

620.9846.621582 - Flores Total:
1582 Flores, Michele

1 25.000.00Cell Phone - Cell Phone
1 140.000.00On Call  - On Call
1 1,708.0080.00Salary - Salary

1,873.0080.0039 - Franklin Total:

39 Franklin, Catherine

1 14.791.11Comp Time Used - Comp Time U
1 106.568.00Holiday - Holiday
1 825.3161.96Hourly - Hourly
1 106.568.00Vacation - Vacation

1,053.2279.071497 - Martinez Total:

1497 Martinez, Joe

1 705.0352.93Hourly - Hourly
705.0352.931556 - Smith Total:

1556 Smith, Mary

GCRP Transit - GCRP Transit Total: 258.62 4,252.23
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Payroll Set:  1-1

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  Health Dept - Health Department

Pay Code
1 140.968.00Holiday - Holiday
1 984.9655.90Hourly - Hourly

1,125.9263.901509 - Mackey Total:

1509 Mackey, Chaliise

Health Dept - Health Department Total: 63.90 1,125.92

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  HIstorical Comm - HIstorical Comm

Pay Code
1 233.6119.50Hourly - Hourly
1 287.5224.00Sick - Sick
1 95.848.00Vacation - Vacation

616.9751.50266 - Breeding Total:

266 Breeding, Lynda

1 249.8423.57Hourly - Hourly
249.8423.571617 - Redfearn Total:

1617 Redfearn, Jacob

HIstorical Comm - HIstorical Comm Total: 75.07 866.81

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  IT  Coordinator - IT Corrdinator

Pay Code
1 144.4014.44Hourly - Hourly

144.4014.441637 - Muro Total:
1637 Muro, Adrian

1 25.000.00Cell Phone - Cell Phone
1 2,941.1180.00Hourly - Hourly

2,966.1180.001570 - Redfearn Total:

1570 Redfearn, Joseph

1 123.608.00Holiday - Holiday
1 722.2946.75Hourly - Hourly
1 429.9727.83Vaction- Payout  - Vaction- Payou

1,275.8682.581607 - Willms Total:

1607 Willms, Wade

IT  Coordinator - IT Corrdinator Total: 177.02 4,386.37

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  Jail - Jail

Pay Code
1 151.848.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,421.7974.91Hourly - Hourly
1 151.848.00Vacation - Vacation

1,725.4790.911579 - Avalos Total:

1579 Avalos, Jesus
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Payroll Set:  1-1

1 146.968.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,469.6080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 570.9420.72Overtime - Overtime

2,187.50108.72155 - Brast Total:

155 Brast, Virginia

1 151.848.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,518.4080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 940.9333.05Overtime - Overtime

2,611.17121.051505 - Castilla Total:

1505 Castilla, Franky

1 146.968.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,469.6080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 190.136.90Overtime - Overtime

1,806.6994.901593 - Cockroft Total:

1593 Cockroft, Timothy

1 200.728.00Holiday - Holiday
1 2,007.2080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 667.6417.74Overtime - Overtime

2,875.56105.7493 - Diaz Total:

93 Diaz, Gerardo

1 147.048.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,470.4080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 483.5817.54Overtime - Overtime

2,101.02105.541634 - Johnson-Klabunde Total:

1634 Johnson-Klabunde, Mason

1 147.048.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,470.4080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 201.987.33Overtime - Overtime

1,819.4295.331594 - McColgan Total:

1594 McColgan, Arthur

1 146.968.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,469.6080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 756.9427.47Overtime - Overtime
1 146.968.00Vacation - Vacation

2,520.46123.471514 - Ramos Total:

1514 Ramos, Trinidad

1 147.048.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,470.4080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 757.9027.49Overtime - Overtime

2,375.34115.491626 - Robbins Total:

1626 Robbins, Amanda

Jail - Jail Total: 961.15 20,022.63

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  JP Pct #1 - JP Pct #1

Pay Code
1 25.000.00Cell Phone - Cell Phone
1 1,653.340.00Salary - Salary

1,678.340.001572 - Roe Total:

1572 Roe, Herman
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Payroll Set:  1-1

1 64.143.64Comp Time Used - Comp Time U
1 140.968.00Holiday - Holiday
1 767.3543.55Hourly - Hourly
1 296.1916.81Sick - Sick
1 140.968.00Vacation - Vacation

1,409.6080.001408 - Valdez Total:

1408 Valdez, Sylvia

JP Pct #1 - JP Pct #1 Total: 80.00 3,087.94

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  JP Pct #2 - JP Pct #2

Pay Code
1 157.288.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,201.0361.09Hourly - Hourly
1 79.824.06Sick - Sick
1 134.676.85Vacation - Vacation

1,572.8080.001049 - Garcia Rodriguez Total:

1049 Garcia Rodriguez, Ermalinda

1 25.000.00Cell Phone - Cell Phone
1 1,653.3480.00Salary - Salary

1,678.3480.001573 - Schulze Total:

1573 Schulze, James

JP Pct #2 - JP Pct #2 Total: 160.00 3,251.14

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  Library - Library

Pay Code
1 488.9532.97Hourly - Hourly

488.9532.9738 - Hutchinson Total:
38 Hutchinson, Verna Mae

1 1,658.4080.00Hourly - Hourly
1,658.4080.0035 - Janota Total:

35 Janota, Claudine

1 100.827.92Hourly - Hourly
100.827.92402 - New Total:

402 New, Carol

1 96.546.51Hourly - Hourly
96.546.51161 - Parks Total:

161 Parks, Shelley

1 654.2148.46Hourly - Hourly
654.2148.461627 - Rodriguez Total:

1627 Rodriguez, Lisa

1 1.730.10Comp Time Used - Comp Time U
1 138.728.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,125.7164.92Hourly - Hourly
1 86.705.00Sick - Sick
1 34.682.00Vacation - Vacation

1,387.5480.0234 - Sandoval Total:

34 Sandoval, Deborah
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Payroll Set:  1-1

1 253.3017.08Hourly - Hourly
253.3017.081498 - Schneider Total:

1498 Schneider, Kim

Library - Library Total: 272.96 4,639.76

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  Maintenance - Maintenance

Pay Code
1 0.002.87Comp Time Earned - Comp Time 
1 123.608.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,112.4072.00Hourly - Hourly

1,236.0082.8720 - Leal Total:

20 Leal, Teodoro

1 0.001.34Comp Time Earned - Comp Time 
1 117.608.00Holiday - Holiday
1 890.8260.60Hourly - Hourly
1 167.5811.40Vacation - Vacation

1,176.0081.34344 - Torres Total:

344 Torres, Gloria

Maintenance - Maintenance Total: 164.21 2,412.00

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  Sheriff's Deputy - Sheriff Deputy

Pay Code
1 170.168.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,281.3160.24Hourly - Hourly

1,451.4768.241639 - Allen Total:

1639 Allen, Robin

1 170.168.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,701.6080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 825.0625.86Overtime - Overtime

2,696.82113.861609 - Bennett Total:

1609 Bennett, Alex

1 201.928.00Holiday - Holiday
1 492.1819.50Hourly - Hourly

694.1027.501488 - Beyer Total:

1488 Beyer, Michael

1 2,884.62160.00Salary - Salary
2,884.62160.001493 - Boyd Total:

1493 Boyd, Roy

1 187.688.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,876.8080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 655.5918.63Overtime - Overtime

2,720.07106.631587 - Branecky Total:

1587 Branecky, Randall

1 170.168.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,701.6080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 1,103.2734.58Overtime - Overtime

2,975.03122.581619 - Breedlove Total:

1619 Breedlove, Patrick
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Payroll Set:  1-1

1 201.928.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,709.7667.74Hourly - Hourly
1 403.8416.00Sick - Sick

2,315.5291.741580 - Breshears Total:

1580 Breshears, Caleb

1 187.608.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,876.0080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 443.9112.62Overtime - Overtime

2,507.51100.621533 - Cockroft Total:

1533 Cockroft, James

1 187.608.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,788.0676.25Hourly - Hourly

1,975.6684.2595 - Escojido Total:

95 Escojido, Virginia

1 170.168.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,701.6080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 402.6412.62Overtime - Overtime

2,274.40100.621635 - Franco Total:

1635 Franco, Manuel

1 218.968.00Holiday - Holiday
1 2,189.6080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 48.861.19Overtime - Overtime

2,457.4289.191489 - Futch Total:

1489 Futch, Timothy

1 193.688.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,936.8080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 926.0325.50Overtime - Overtime

3,056.51113.50372 - Guerra Total:

372 Guerra, Henry

1 173.448.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,734.4080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 179.515.52Overtime - Overtime

2,087.3593.521495 - Henderson Total:

1495 Henderson, Phoenix

1 148.328.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,483.2080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 92.613.33Overtime - Overtime

1,724.1391.33100 - Hoff Total:

100 Hoff, Jayne

1 170.088.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,700.8080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 688.5121.59Overtime - Overtime

2,559.39109.591501 - Keller Total:

1501 Keller, Pedro

1 187.608.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,876.0080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 237.786.76Overtime - Overtime

2,301.3894.76230 - Krucenski Total:

230 Krucenski, Michael
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Payroll Set:  1-1

1 170.168.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,701.6080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 260.348.16Overtime - Overtime

2,132.1096.161612 - O'Brien Total:

1612 O'Brien, Sean

1 187.608.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,576.0767.21Hourly - Hourly
1 562.8024.00Vacation - Vacation

2,326.4799.211563 - Robles Total:

1563 Robles, Lawrence

1 170.168.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,701.6080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 240.887.55Overtime - Overtime

2,112.6495.551486 - Saenz Total:

1486 Saenz, Scott

1 170.088.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,376.1664.73Hourly - Hourly
1 510.2424.00Vacation - Vacation

2,056.4896.731494 - Slovak Total:

1494 Slovak, Melvin

1 187.688.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,876.8080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 402.9311.45Overtime - Overtime

2,467.4199.451584 - Thompson Total:

1584 Thompson, Jeffrey

1 170.168.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,701.6080.00Hourly - Hourly
1 440.6113.81Overtime - Overtime

2,312.37101.811610 - Trench Total:

1610 Trench, Dustin

1 187.608.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,057.6045.10Hourly - Hourly
1 938.0040.00Vacation - Vacation

2,183.2093.10253 - Williams Total:

253 Williams, Mark

Sheriff's Deputy - Sheriff Deputy Total: 2,249.94 52,272.05

Employee Number Employee Name # of Payments Units Pay Amount

Department:  Tax Assessor - Tax Assessor Collector

Pay Code
1 1,978.400.00Salary - Salary

1,978.400.001251 - Garcia Total:
1251 Garcia, Michelle

1 5.840.30Comp Time Used - Comp Time U
1 155.928.00Holiday - Holiday
1 1,047.5953.75Hourly - Hourly
1 155.928.00Sick - Sick
1 193.939.95Vacation - Vacation

1,559.2080.0031 - Perry  Total:

31 Perry , Eileen
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Payroll Set:  1-1

1 0.001.35Comp Time Earned - Comp Time 
1 109.448.00Holiday - Holiday
1 998.9173.02Hourly - Hourly

1,108.3582.371605 - Soto Total:

1605 Soto, Ananissa

1 0.001.46Comp Time Earned - Comp Time 
1 109.448.00Holiday - Holiday
1 999.4673.06Hourly - Hourly

1,108.9082.521628 - Tyler Total:

1628 Tyler, Leann

Tax Assessor - Tax Assessor Collector Total: 244.89 5,754.85

9,615.35 221,309.95Report Total:
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County of Goliad, TX

Account Summary
Payroll Report for Comm Court

6/21/2024 - 6/21/2024

Payroll Set:  1-1

Account Account Description Pay AmountUnits
**BENEFIT AND NON GL TRANSACTIONS** 0.0030.57

-  Total: 0.0030.57
012-101-40100 SALARY, COUNTY JUDGE 2,097.430.00
012-101-40200 SALARY, SECRETARY 704.8040.00
012-101-40300 STATE SALARY SUPPLEMENT 969.230.00
012-101-40400 SALARY, GRANT WRITER 912.1551.68
012-101-42000 TELEPHONE STIPEND 37.500.00
012-103-40100 SALARY, COUNTY CLERK 1,978.350.00
012-103-40200 SALARIES, DEPUTIES 4,574.86317.05
012-114-40100 SALARY, JP.#1 1,653.340.00
012-114-40200 SALARY, SECRETARY 1,409.6080.00
012-114-42000 TELEPHONE STIPEND 25.000.00
012-115-40100 SALARY, JUSTICE OF PEACE 1,653.3480.00
012-115-40200 SALARY, J.P. SECRETARY 1,572.8080.00
012-115-42000 TELEPHONE STIPEND 25.000.00
012-121-40100 SALARY, ELECTION ADMIN 1,368.8080.00
012-130-40100 SALARY, COUNTY TREASURER 1,880.570.00
012-130-40200 SALARY, DEPUTIES 1,409.6080.00
012-131-40100 SALARY, COUNTY AUDITOR 2,448.220.00
012-132-40100 SALARY, TAX A/C 1,978.400.00
012-132-40200 SALARIES, DEPUTIES 3,776.45242.08
012-133-40200 SALARY, CO. ATTNY. SECRETARY 1,780.8080.00
012-134-40100 INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY 2,941.1180.00
012-134-40400 PART-TIME HELP 1,420.2697.02
012-134-42000 TELEPHONE STIPEND 25.000.00
012-140-40200 CUSTODIAN/JANITOR 1,176.0080.00
012-140-40300 SALARY,TRANSFER STATION ATTENDANT 1,236.0080.00
012-150-40100 SALARY, EMS DIRECTOR 2,263.8880.00
012-150-40200 SALARIES, PARAMEDICS 10,512.84553.48
012-150-40300 SALARIES, EMT I'S 7,986.10535.94
012-150-40400 PART TIME PARAMEDICS 2,112.85111.85
012-150-40500 PART TIME EMT'S 917.5464.05
012-150-40600 OVERTIME - PARAMEDICS (FULL TIME) 5,960.91209.34
012-150-40700 OVERTIME - EMT'S (FULL TIME) 3,905.30161.20
012-150-40800 OVERTIME - PARAMEDICS (PART TIME) 1,991.9272.34
012-151-40100 SALARY, CONSTABLE #1 1,039.351.00
012-152-40100 SALARY, CONSTABE #2 1,039.3540.00
012-153-40100 SALRY EMER MGMT COORD 704.8040.00
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Payroll Set:  1-1

Account Account Description Pay AmountUnits
012-153-40200 SALARY, FIRE MARSHALL 1,857.3658.39
012-153-42000 TELEPHONE STIPEND 12.500.00
012-154-40100 SALARY, SHERIFF 2,097.4380.00
012-154-40200 SECRETARY 1,724.1391.33
012-154-40300 SALARIES, DEPUTIES 30,436.421,340.30
012-154-40350 OVERTIME, DEPUTIES 5,913.89178.30
012-154-40400 SALARIES, DISPATCHERS 11,996.85618.30
012-154-40450 OVERTIME, DISPATCHERS 775.8228.14
012-154-40500 SALARY, JAILERS 15,452.59802.91
012-154-40550 OVERTIME, JAILERS 4,570.04158.24
012-155-40100 SALARIES, SRO 2,063.6088.00
012-155-40350 SRO OVERTIME 237.786.76
012-180-40100 HISTORICAL MUSEUM CLERK 866.8175.07
012-181-40100 SALARY - HEALTH SERVICES DIRECTOR 1,125.9263.90
012-182-40100 SALARY, LIBRARIAN 1,658.4080.00
012-182-40200 SALARIES, LIBRARIANS 1,387.5480.02
012-182-40300 LIBRARY AIDES - PT 1,593.82112.94
012-190-40100 SALARY, COUNTY AGENT 650.020.00
012-190-40150 VEHICLE ALLOWANCE 259.610.00
012-190-40200 SALARY, SECRETARY 602.8551.35
012-190-40300 SALARY, 4-H COORDINATOR 1,667.3280.43
012-190-42000 TELEPHONE STIPEND 50.000.00

012 - GENERAL FUND Total: 164,490.157,331.41
021-210-40100 SALARY, COMMISSIONER 1,892.590.00
021-210-40150 VEHICLE ALLOWANCE 384.620.00
021-210-40200 SALARIES, LABOR 5,424.02316.00
021-210-42000 TELEPHONE STIPEND 25.000.00

021 - ROAD AND BRIDGE - PRECINCT #1 Total: 7,726.23316.00
022-220-40100 SALARY, COMMISSIONER 1,892.590.00
022-220-40150 VEHICLE ALLOWANCE 384.620.00
022-220-40200 SALARIES, LABOR 3,906.24205.37
022-220-40400 SALARIES, PART-TIME 73.564.00
022-220-42000 TELEPHONE STIPEND 25.000.00

022 - ROAD AND BRIDGE - PRECINCT #2 Total: 6,282.01209.37
023-230-40100 SALARY, COMMISSIONER 1,892.590.00
023-230-40150 VEHICLE ALLOWANCE 384.620.00
023-230-40200 SALARIES, LABOR 2,746.83159.98
023-230-40400 SALARIES, PART-TIME 2,386.33183.57
023-230-42000 TELEPHONE STIPEND 25.000.00

023 - ROAD AND BRIDGE - PRECINCT #3 Total: 7,435.37343.55
024-240-40100 SALARY, COMMISSIONER 1,892.590.00
024-240-40150 VEHICLE ALLOWANCE 384.620.00
024-240-40200 SALARIES, LABOR 2,892.80160.00
024-240-40400 SALARIES, PART-TIME 1,576.28100.68
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Payroll Set:  1-1

Account Account Description Pay AmountUnits
024-240-60210 TELEPHONE EXPENSE 25.000.00

024 - ROAD AND BRIDGE - PRECINCT #4 Total: 6,771.29260.68
026-260-40100 SALARY, I & R COORDINATOR 1,708.0080.00
026-260-40300 SALARY, VAN DRIVER (PART-TIME) 2,379.23178.62
026-260-42000 TELEPHONE STIPEND 25.000.00
026-260-43800 TRANSIT ON-CALL 140.000.00

026 - GCRP GRANT Total: 4,252.23258.62
052-520-40300 SB22 - SALARY SUPPLEMENT - SHERIFF 787.1980.00

052 - SB 22 - STATE SALARY MANDATE Total: 787.1980.00
082-820-40100 SALARY, ADA'S 8,269.23160.00
082-820-40200 SALARY, SECRETARY 4,305.79159.90
082-820-40500 SALARY, PART TIME 1,978.8580.00

082 - DISTRICT ATTORNEY Total: 14,553.87399.90
089-890-40100 SALARIES - PATROL DEPUTIES /  INVESTIGATOR 8,307.36364.47
089-890-40300 OVERTIME - PATROL DEPUTIES/INVESTIGATOR 704.2520.78

089 - OPERATION LONE STAR GRANT Total: 9,011.61385.25
Report Total: 221,309.959,615.35
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County of Goliad, TX

Pay Code Summary
Payroll Report for Comm Court

6/21/2024 - 6/21/2024

Payroll Set:  1-1

Pay Code Description Pay Amount# of Payments Units
Cell Phone - Cell Phone Cell Phone 300.0012 0.00
Comp Time Earned - CompComp Time Earned 0.0013 30.57
Comp Time Used - Comp TComp Time Used 386.299 20.45
Holiday - Holiday Holiday 12,394.9681 648.00
Hourly - Hourly Hourly 126,070.38108 6,700.57
On Call  - On Call On Call 140.001 0.00
Overtime - Overtime Overtime 24,152.5241 838.43
Salary - Salary Salary 41,939.4620 682.00
Sick - Sick Sick 3,262.1817 181.54
State Suppliment - State S State Suppliment 969.231 0.00
Vacation - Vacation Vacation 6,631.3921 332.72
Vaction- Payout  - Vaction Vaction- Payout 3,265.453 181.07
Vehicle Allowance - Vehicl Vehicle Allowance 1,798.095 0.00

Report Total: 221,309.959,615.35

























































































































































































































































































2023 R Materials Bid List

1 Crushed Limestone 3/8" Precinct 1 Precinct 2 Precinct 3 Precinct 4 

ABN Construction No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Atascosa Materials 44.00/TON 44.00/TON 40.00/TON 45.00/TON

Delivery Surcharge:  $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton

Cat Skinner, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

McMahan Services, Ltd. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Vulcan Construction Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

2 Crushed Limestone 5/8" Precinct 1 Precinct 2 Precinct 3 Precinct 4 

ABN Construction No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Atascosa Materials 44.00/TON 44.00/TON 40.00/TON 45.00/TON

Delivery Surcharge:  $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton

Cat Skinner, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

McMahan Services, Ltd. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Vulcan Construction Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  
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2023 R Materials Bid List

3
Type PB, Grade 4 Pre-coated 

Aggregates
Precinct 1 Precinct 2 Precinct 3 Precinct 4 

ABN Construction No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Atascosa Materials 71.50/TON 72.25/TON 68.75/TON 72.50/TON

Delivery Surcharge:  $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton

Cat Skinner, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

McMahan Services, Ltd. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Vulcan Construction Materials $87.08/TON $87.15/TON $86.00/TON $88.30/TON

Delivery Surcharge:  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 

4 PREMIX TYPE "D" Precinct 1 Precinct 2 Precinct 3 Precinct 4 

ABN Construction No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Atascosa Materials 105.00/TON 105.00/TON 105.00/TON 105.00/TON

Delivery Surcharge:  $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton

Cat Skinner, LLCMaterials, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

McMahan Services, Ltd. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Vulcan Construction Materials $119.08/TON $119.15/TON $118.00/TON $120.30/TON

Delivery Surcharge:  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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2023 R Materials Bid List

5
TOPPING ROCK - PEA 

GRAVEL 3/8"
Precinct 1 Precinct 2 Precinct 3 Precinct 4 

ABN Construction No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Atascosa Materials $50.00/Ton $50.00/Ton $48.75/Ton $52.00/Ton

Delivery Surcharge:  $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton

Cat Skinner, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

McMahan Services, Ltd. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Vulcan Construction Materials $37.25/TON $41.71/TON $41.40/TON $36.20/TON

Delivery Surcharge:  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6
TOPPING ROCK - PEA 

GRAVEL 5/8"
Precinct 1 Precinct 2 Precinct 3 Precinct 4 

ABN Construction No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Atascosa Materials $52.50/Ton $52.50/Ton $51.25.Ton $54.50/Ton

Delivery Surcharge:  $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00

Cat Skinner, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

McMahan Services, Ltd. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Vulcan Construction Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  
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2023 R Materials Bid List

7
STATE APPROVED ROAD 

BASE
Precinct 1 Precinct 2 Precinct 3 Precinct 4 

ABN Construction
$23.00/TON                

to Co. Barn

$25.00/TON                   

to Co. Barn

$21.00/TON                   

to Co. Barn

$20.00/TON                   

to Co. Barn

Delivery Surcharge:  $5.00/Ton to Job Site $5.00/Ton to Job Site $5.00/Ton to Job Site $5.00/Ton to Job Site

Atascosa Materials                                      No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Cat Skinner, LLC $28.40/TON  $33.80/TON  $24.00/TON  $22.80/TON 

* See Bid Sheet for Material detail

Delivery Surcharge:  

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

McMahan Services, Ltd. $12.00/TON $12.00/TON $12.00/TON $12.00/TON

Delivery Surcharge:  Delivery Not Available Delivery Not Available Delivery Not Available Delivery Not Available

Vulcan Construction Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

9 PIT RUN GRAVEL Precinct 1 Precinct 2 Precinct 3 Precinct 4 

ABN Construction
$20.00/TON                

to Co. barn

$22.00/TON                  

to Co. barn

$18.00/TON                  

to Co. barn

$17.00/TON                  

to Co. barn

Delivery Surcharge:  $5.00/Ton to Job Site $5.00/Ton to Job Site $5.00/Ton to Job Site $5.00/Ton to Job Site

Atascosa Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Cat Skinner, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

McMahan Services, Ltd.                                                  $11.00/TON $11.00/TON $11.00/TON $11.00/TON

Delivery Surcharge:  Delivery Not Available Delivery Not Available Delivery Not Available Delivery Not Available

Vulcan Construction Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  
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2023 R Materials Bid List

10 PIT RUN CALICHE Precinct 1 Precinct 2 Precinct 3 Precinct 4 

ABN Construcion No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Atascosa Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Cat Skinner, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

McMahan Services, Ltd. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Vulcan Construction Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

11
CRUSHED LIMESTONE BASE 

3/4" TO DUST
Precinct 1 Precinct 2 Precinct 3 Precinct 4 

ABN Construcion No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Atascosa Materials $34.50/Ton $34.50/Ton $34.50/Ton $35.50/Ton

Delivery Surcharge:  $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton

Cat Skinner, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

McMahan Services, Ltd. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Vulcan Construction Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  
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2023 R Materials Bid List

12
CRUSHED LIMESTONE BASE 

1 1/2" TO DUST
Precinct 1 Precinct 2 Precinct 3 Precinct 4 

ABN Construcion No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Atascosa Materials $34.50/Ton $34.50/Ton $34.50/Ton $35.50/Ton

Delivery Surcharge:  $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton

Cat Skinner, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

McMahan Services, Ltd. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Vulcan Construction Materials $67.48/TON $65.02/TON $71.79/TON $72.41/TON

See Notes on Bid Sheet

Delivery Surcharge:  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

17 CSS - 1 / CSS - 1H Precinct 1 Precinct 2 Precinct 3 Precinct 4 

ABN Construction No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Atascosa Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Cat Skinner, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions 726.30/TON 726.30/TON 726.30/TON 726.30/TON

Delivery Surcharge:  Federal Enviromental fee will be added to above prices at rate of $0.49770/ton for asphalt & polymer loads or $.00150/gal for emulsion loads

McMahan Services, Ltd. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Vulcan Construction Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  
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2023 R Materials Bid List

18 SS - 1 / SS - 1H Precinct 1 Precinct 2 Precinct 3 Precinct 4 

ABN Construcion No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Atascosa Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Cat Skinner, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions 726.30/TON 726.30/TON 726.30/TON 726.30/TON

Delivery Surcharge:  Federal Enviromental fee will be added to above prices at rate of $0.49770/ton for asphalt & polymer loads or $.00150/gal for emulsion loads

McMahan Services, Ltd. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Vulcan Construction Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

19 CRS - 2 Precinct 1 Precinct 2 Precinct 3 Precinct 4 

ABN Construcion No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Atascosa Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Cat Skinner, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions 714.40/TON 714.40/TON 714.40/TON 714.40/TON

Delivery Surcharge:  Federal Enviromental fee will be added to above prices at rate of $0.49770/ton for asphalt & polymer loads or $.00150/gal for emulsion loads

McMahan Services, Ltd. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Vulcan Construction Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  
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2023 R Materials Bid List

20
RAP MATERIAL - RECYCLED 

ASPHALT PAVEMENT
Precinct 1 Precinct 2 Precinct 3 Precinct 4 

ABN Construction No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Atascosa Materials $36.00/Ton $36.00/Ton $36.00/Ton $37.00/Ton

Delivery Surcharge:  $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton

Cat Skinner, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

McMahan Services, Ltd. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Vulcan Construction Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

21
HOT MIX HOT LAY 

MATERIAL
Precinct 1 Precinct 2 Precinct 3 Precinct 4 

ABN Construction No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Atascosa Materials $93.00/TON $93.00/TON $93.00/TON $93.50/TON

Delivery Surcharge:  $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton $1.00/Ton

Cat Skinner, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

McMahan Services, Ltd. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  

Vulcan Construction Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery Surcharge:  
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2018-2019 Road Materials Bid 

List Commissioner's Court 

1 Crushed Limestone 3/8"
Precinct 1 Precinct 2 Precinct 3 Precinct 4 PickUp

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$32.00 TON

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$35.00 TON

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$32.00 TON

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$33.00 TON

THE ROCK   $16.00   

NEW BRANUFELS

Delivery Surcharge:  $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00

Delivery Surcharge:  

Delivery Surcharge:  

2 Crushed Limestone 5/8"
Precinct 1 Precinct 2 Precinct 3 Precinct 4 PickUp

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$33.00 TON

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$36.00 TON

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$33.00 TON

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$34.00 TON

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$17.00   NEW 

BRANUFELS

Delivery Surcharge:  $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00

Delivery Surcharge:  

Delivery Surcharge:  

3

Type PB, Grade 4 Pre-coated 

Aggregates Precinct 1 Precinct 2 Precinct 3 Precinct 4 PickUp
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2018-2019 Road Materials Bid 

List Commissioner's Court 

Delivery Surcharge:  

Vulcan Const Materials 

$53.19/Ton

Vulcan Const Materials 

$54.79/Ton

Vulcan Const Materials 

$54.00/Ton

Vulcan Const Materials 

$55.59/Ton

Vulcan Const Materials 

$22.00/Ton  P/U

Delivery Surcharge:  

Delivery Surcharge:  

4 PREMIX TYPE "D"
Precinct 1 Precinct 2 Precinct 3 Precinct 4 PickUp

Delivery Surcharge:  

Vulcan Const Materials 

$71.19/Ton

Vulcan Const Materials 

$72.79/Ton

Vulcan Const Materials 

$72.00/Ton

Vulcan Const Materials 

$73.59/Ton

Vulcan Const Materials 

$40.00/Ton 

Delivery Surcharge:  

5
TOPPING ROCK - PEA 

GRAVEL 3/8"

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$28.50 TON

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$28.50 TON

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$28.50 TON

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$28.50 TON

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$17.00

Delivery Surcharge:  

$1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00

Delivery Surcharge:  

Delivery Surcharge:  

C:\Temp\cI\Trlj2a8C\2024-_R_B_Tally.xls Page  10



2018-2019 Road Materials Bid 

List Commissioner's Court 

6

TOPPING ROCK - PEA 

GRAVEL 5/8"

NO BIDS

Delivery Surcharge:  

Delivery Surcharge:  

Delivery Surcharge:  

7

STATE APPROVED ROAD 

BASE
Vulcan Const Materials 

$35.25/Ton

Vulcan Const Materials 

$34.75/Ton

Vulcan Const Materials 

$37.45/Ton

Vulcan Const Materials 

$37.45/Ton

Vulcan Const Materials 

$20.50/Ton 

Delivery Surcharge:  N/B N/B N/B N/B N/B

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$27.00 TON

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$31.00 TON

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$28.00 TON

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$27.00 TON

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$15.00  TON

Delivery Surcharge:  $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00

8 STABILIZATION CEMENT  
CONVERSION - 1.3 PER CUBIC YD

Delivery Surcharge:  

Delivery Surcharge:  
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2018-2019 Road Materials Bid 

List Commissioner's Court 

9 PIT RUN GRAVEL
THE ROCK TRUCK 

$24.00 CUBIC YD

THE ROCK TRUCK  

$28.00 CUBIC YD

THE ROCK TRUCK 

$25.00 CUBIC YD

THE ROCK TRUCK 

$24.00 CUBIC YD

THE ROCK TRUCK 

$17.00  CUBIC YD

Delivery Surcharge:  $1 $1 $1 $1

10 PIT RUN CALICHE
THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$20.00 TON

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$20.00 TON

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$20.00 TON

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$20.00 TON

THE ROCK TRUCK 

$8.00  TON    Pettus

$1 $1 $1 $1

11

CRUSHED LIMESTONE BASE 

3/4" TO DUST

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$24.00 TON

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$26.00 TON

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$23.00 TON

THE ROCK TRUCKING 

$24.00 TON

THE ROCK TRUCK 

$28.00  TON  Victoria

Delivery Surcharge:  $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00

Delivery Surcharge:  C:\Temp\cI\Trlj2a8C\2024-_R_B_Tally.xls Page  12



2018-2019 Road Materials Bid 

List Commissioner's Court 
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2018-2019 Road Materials Bid 

List Commissioner's Court 

12
CRUSHED LIMESTONE BASE 

1 1/2" TO DUST

Delivery Surcharge:  

THE ROCK TRUCKING THE ROCK TRUCKING THE ROCK TRUCKING THE ROCK TRUCKING THE ROCK TRUCKING 

Delivery Surcharge:  $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00

Vulcan Const Materials 

$35.25/Ton

Vulcan Const Materials 

$34.75/Ton

Vulcan Const Materials 

$37.45/Ton

Vulcan Const Materials 

$37.45/Ton

Vulcan Const Materials 

$20.50/Ton 

Delivery Surcharge:  

13
CRS-2 TxDOT SPECS ITEM 

300

Delivery Surcharge:  

Delivery Surcharge:  

Delivery Surcharge:  
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2018-2019 Road Materials Bid 

List Commissioner's Court 

14
WASHED BOTTOM ASH - 

ROAD TOPPING
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2018-2019 Road Materials Bid 

List Commissioner's Court 
Delivery Surcharge:  

Delivery Surcharge:  

15
BOTTOM ASH - USED FOR 

ROAD BASE
Delivery Surcharge:  

NO BIDS
Delivery Surcharge:  

16
TOP - SCREENED BOTTOM 

ASH
Delivery Surcharge:  

NO BIDS
Delivery Surcharge:  
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2018-2019 Road Materials Bid 

List Commissioner's Court 

17 CSS - 1 / CSS - 1H
Martin Asphalt Co  

$2.43/Gal

Martin Asphalt Co  

$2.43/Gal

Martin Asphalt Co  

$2.43/Gal

Martin Asphalt Co  

$2.43/Gal

Martin Asphalt Co  

$2.25/Gal

Delivery Surcharge:  N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

ERGON                 $2.35 

GAL

ERGON                 $2.34 ERGON                 $2.35 ERGON                 $2.35 

GAL

ERGON                 

$2.20GAL  -P/U

Delivery Surcharge:  N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

18 SS - 1 / SS - 1H
Martin Asphalt Co  

$2.13/Gal

Martin Asphalt Co  

$2.13/Gal

Martin Asphalt Co  

$2.13/Gal

Martin Asphalt Co  

$2.13/Gal

Martin Asphalt Co  

$1.95/Gal

Delivery Surcharge:  N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

ERGON                 $2.34 

GAL

ERGON                 $2.34 

GAL

ERGON                 

$2.35GAL

ERGON                 $2.35 

GAL

ERGON                   

$2.20 GAL   P/U

Delivery Surcharge:  N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
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2018-2019 Road Materials Bid 

List Commissioner's Court 

19 CRS - 2
Martin Asphalt Co  

$2.18/Gal

Martin Asphalt Co  

$2.18/Gal

Martin Asphalt Co  

$2.18/Gal

Martin Asphalt Co  

$2.18/Gal

Martin Asphalt Co  

$2.18/Gal

Delivery Surcharge:  N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

ERGON               

$556.60 TON                

$2.34 GAL

ERGON               $555.6 

TON                $2.34 

GAL

ERGON               

$557.60  TON                

$2.35 GAL

ERGON               $558.60  

TON                $2.35 GAL

Delivery Surcharge:  N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

20
RAP MATERIAL - RECYCLED 

ASPHALT PAVEMENT

Delivery Surcharge:  

NO BIDS
Delivery Surcharge:  
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2018-2019 Road Materials Bid 

List Commissioner's Court 

21
HOT MIX HOT LAY 

MATERIAL
Delivery Surcharge:  

NO BIDS
Delivery Surcharge:  

C:\Temp\cI\Trlj2a8C\2024-_R_B_Tally.xls Page  19




















































































































































































	MEETING OF THE COMMISSIONERS COURT

